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New companies 
in a brave, 
new Europe 
A true European company, 
incorporated in Luxem­
bourg, built on a green field 
site, with vice presidents 
from at least five Commu­
nity countries, financed by 
capital from across the 
Fommunity. That is the 
means. 

Targeting for 20 per cent of 
the European market in 2 
micron CMOS chips for sys­
tem houses. That is the aim. 

~way with the "every coun­
try must have its own cham­
pion manufacturer". That is 
the concept to be avoided. 

Dr Robb Wilmot, chairman 
of STC and ICL, Britain's 
largest computer manufac­
turer, has concluded that the 
supply side of the economy 
needs a radically new · ap­
proach. "IBM Europe often 
claims to be more European 
than most of our own com­
panies . . . Critical mass is, 
hard to come by in Europe 
because of the fatal desire of 
every country to have its 
own national champion, and 
bigger countries to have sev­
eral believing that it creates 
competition. This crowding 
out process means that it is 
very difficult for any Euro­
pean company to achieve 
more than I or 2 per cent 
world market share." He es­
timates that a major corn­
Continued on p 2. 

Co~ion unveils 
information market 
policy programme 
The European Commission 
has announced a new pro­
gramme to unblock or free 
up market related aspects of 
the new information techno­
logies. The initiative res­
ponds to the call of the Eu­
ropean Council meeting in 
Brussels on 29 and 30 March 
for the realisation of a com­
mon information market as 
a specific Community goal. 

The Commission's Commu­
nication to Council I of 21 
November on "a work pro­
gramme for creating a com­
mon information market" 
underlines the key role of in­
formation for trade and in­
dustry, the problems faced 
by the European informa­
tion market and the urgent 
need to create the right mar­
ket conditions for advanced 
European information serv­
ices. 

Europe, traditionally strong 
in the press and publishing 
sectors, produces fewer than 
half as many data bases ac­
cessible online than the U.S. 
The turnover of European 
providers of electronic spe­
cialised information is esti­
mated at only one fifth of 
that achieved by their U.S. 
counterparts. Current mar­
ket conditions are such that, 
with a few rare exceptions, 
most of the online European 
information service sup­
pliers are unable to recoup 
their investment costs with­
out state support. 

Previous Community initia­
tives (such as ESPRIT, IN­
SIS, parts of FAST and the 
action programme on tele­
communications) are, how-

ever, primarily concerned 
with the technology rather 
than the information aspect 
of new information technol­
ogies (NIT). The work-pro­
gramme introduced by the 
Communication aims at fill­
ing this gap by initiating ac­
tions to strengthen the com­
petitiveness and marketing 

capabilities of European in­
formation services; reduce 
the uncertainties and obsta­
cles to the development of 
the market; stimulate de­
mand ; and promote conver­
gence of policies within the 
Community in view of de­
velopments in the interna­
tional field. The outcome of 

Continued on p 2. 

M Michel Poniatowski, president de la commission de l'energie, da la recherche 
et de la technologie du Parlement europeen, s'adresse aux spectateurs a l'expo 
Europe 2000, qui eut lieu a Strasbourg en Octobre. 

)( 



2 

New companies from p 1. 

pany needs at least 5 per 
cent of the global market to 
survive. 
Wilmot's second key point is 
the need for organisational 
capability to win globally. 
The new company European 
Silicon Structures, ES2, will 
have products that can be 
produced in higher volumes 
in foundries across Europe. 
Dr Wilmot suggests this 
mechanism may only be ap­
plicable to certain parts of 
the IT industry, where ex­
treme economy-of-scale sen­
sitivity or the market needs 
standardised products. For 
such sectors he is encourag­
ing the Community and na­
tional administrations to 
create the concept of a Qual­
ifying European Enterprise 
(QEE) which would benefit 
from special legislation., 
equalised tax treatment and 
a re-think about how gov­
ernments consider subsidies. 

Information providers 
The benefits of establishing 
a company across the Com­
munity dimension are at 
least as critical for compan­
ies trying to respond to the 
market in Software. A few 
examples of this are given in 
the article on networks page 
8 of this issue. 
The need is even more se­
rious when the market in In­
formation-ware is consid­
ered. On how the Commun­
ity manages to maximise the 
intellectual and commercial 
potential of its 320 million 
citizens will depend the rela­
tive prosperity of the next 
generation. 
A teleshopping system exists 
in the USA. Who will supply 
the multilingual computer 
translation interface for a 
machine like that described 
on page 3 to function across 
Europe? Automatic transla­
tion techniques now ensure 
80 o/o or better accuracy. Yet 
even at the level of the hum-

ble telex, there is no translat­
ing interface provided by 
PTTs or commercial com­
panies to ease intra-euro­
pean communications. 

For European Value Added 
Networks to flourish, much 
of the electronic information 
presently available and a 
good deal more yet to be 
created needs to be acces­
sible to the widest possible 
audience. 
This type of operation 
would perhaps need the Eu­
ropean Commission to act 
as an honest broker between 
providers of the different in­
formation services. In the 
past the Commission has 
helped bring firms together 
across Europe, both in the 
DOCDEL experiments base 
production and also in the 
framework of ESPRIT. 
A recent Midterm Review of 
Espirit found 97 .5 % of par­
ticipants asked thought this 
R & D programme fostered 
European cooperation. The 
Review Board . recom­
mended progress on down­
stream projects. 

New information services 
will need a new financial, 
regulatory and network in­
frastructure which will en­
courage such ventures to be 
built on a European base. It 
will also need new mecha­
nisms for bringing together 
interest groups across Eu­
rope who want to cooperate 
to create new value added 
services. This is the concept 
behind the suggestion for an 
Information Market Pro­
gramme for the Promotion 
and Introduction of Com­
mon Technologies, IM­
PACT (see IM no 40, pi). 

If the going looks tough 
now, as Dr Wilmott can tes­
tify, it will be even toughei 
in the next few years unless 
a start is made on building a 
true Common Market for in­
formation. 
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New programme from p 1. 

the analytical work done by 
the Commission so far 
shows that priority attention 
is required in eight areas : 
I. Role of the public sector 

(both in supplying infor­
mation and supporting 
information services) 

2. Legal aspects (including 
intellectual property, da­
ta protection, health and 
safety regulations, new 
problems created by NIT 
services, etc.) 

3. Economic aspects (in­
cluding improved statis­
tical, technical and mar­
ket trends information, 
research on socio-eco­
nomic aspects of infor­
mation and communica­
tion, etc.) 

4. Removing barriers to in­
formation flows (har­
monisation of standards, 
improved telecommuni­
cations and postal facili ­
ties) 

5. Use of and demand for 
advanced information 
services (stimulation of 
use and demand, im­
proved access to NIT 
services for non-expert 
users, educational cam­
paigns) 

6. Convergence of national 
and Community policies 
(identification and pur­
suit of Community inter-

ests in external relations, 
closer links with less in­
dustrialized countries) 

7. Fiscal and commercial 
environment (accounting 
rules and practices, fiscal 
and custom treatment, 
advertising rules on elec­
tronic information ser­
vices) 

8. Participation of the less 
favoured regions (LFRs) 
in the advanced informa­
tion services market (ac­
tion plan to reduce the 
development lag of 
Community LFRs with 
respect to the use and 
supply of advanced in­
formation services and 
the required telecoms in­
frastructure). 

A special Member State ad­
visory group, consisting of 
senior representatives of 
competent national minis­
tries, will be established to 
help the Commission carry 
out this programme and 
coordinate relevant activities 
in the Member States. The 
Commission will present a 
report on progress within 
one year following its Com­
munication. 

1 Commission document COM (85) 
658. 
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Teleshopping 
information kiosk 

Credit card slots in on the left. 

On a trip away from home 
and you want to order some 
chairs for the kitchen? All 
this may be possible from 
the comfort of your hotel or 
an airport lobby with a new 
teleshopping kiosk made in 
France. 

Much like a telephone 
booth, the TYi (Terminal de 
Vente Image or Image sales 
terminal) comprises a vi­
deodisk reader for Philips, 

Sony or Pioneer, a disk 
which can stock some 54 OOO 
images, a 42 cm colour mon­
itor ... and stereo sound. A 
small micro computer drives 
the system. A touch sensitive 
flat keyboard enables the 
user to indicate his choices 
of the range and specifics of 
his purchase. A built in 
clock keeps track of opera­
tions. 

Telecommunications is pos­
sible via an integrated 
modem which permits the 
terminal to be attached to a 
distant computer host. To 
facilitate payments, the 
user' s credit card or chip 
card can be debited elec­
tronically on the machine. A 
printer can be attached un­
der the table which gives the 
purchaser a record of all the 

goods he has bought, to­
gether with details of deliv­
ery dates. 

Teleshopping is just one of 
the possibilities for this ver­
satile machine. It could also 
be set up for database inter­
rogation or public informa­
tion supply. 
Contact : I-COM 

21 av Casimir Perier 
F-10400 Nogent s/Seine 
Tel: +33 25 39 0134 

Materials databank user 
guidance system 
The European Commission 
DG XIII has published a 
call for tenders for a user 
guidance system to be devel­
oped in conjunction with the 
materials databanks Demon­
strator Programme (IM 40 
p7). 

This will provide a uniform 
online appearance for a 
number of cooperating data­
banks, as far as the user is 
concerned. The general ob­
jective of the user guidance 
system is to contribute to the 

removing of some of the 
basic obstacles present for 
access to information which 
is partly administrative and 
partly technical in nature. 
The contractor would de­
velop the system to give the 
appearance of a coherent 
information service in co­
operation with the data­
banks cooperating in the 
project. 
Contact: Mr G Steven 

CEC, DG XIII/B 
L-2920 Luxembourg 
Tel: +352 4301 2873 

Artificial intelligence 
A workshop organised by 
the European Commission, 
DG XIII, was held at Lux­
embourg on 13 September to 
bring together both techni­
cians and users of artificial 
intelligence as a means of re­
ducing the skills and expert­
ise necessary for accessing 
online information systems. 
The workshop helped iden­
tify requirements and oppor­
tunities for AI based sys­
tems, summarized practical 

experience of such system 
and their implications for 
database construction. A 
fourth session related to spe­
cific applications for scien­
tific, medical, legal patent 
business trade and economic 
information. The proceed­
ings will be published in the 
form of a book. 
Contact : Franco Mustroddi 

CEC, DG XIII/B 
L-1471 Luxembourg 

Dialoguez avec Saphir 
Destine essentiellement aux 
non-informaticiens, Saphir 
est un veritable interprete 
qui permet a n'importe quel 
utilisateur d'interroger des 
bases de donnees sans en 
connaitre le langage d'acces 
particulier. 

Premier logiciel de ce type 
en langue fran~aise, Saphir 
est un analyseur du langage 
naturel d'utiulisation ex­
tremement souple puisqu'il 
offre la possibilite d'utiliser 
une syntaxe tres simple 
(practiquement celle du 
fran~ais) et de dialoguer 
ainsi avec le systeme de ges-
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tion de bases de donnees 
dans la base et leur codifica­
tion . 

lnterprete intelligent, Saphir 
est capable d'engager un 
dialogue avec l'utilisateur, 
afin de lever ambiguites et 
incertitudes (telles que fautes 
d 'orthographe) et suggerer, 
en cas d'imprecisions, dif­
ferentes interpretations pos­
sibles. 
Contacter: ERLI 

72 quai des Carrieres 
F-94220 Charenton 
Tel : +33 14 893 8121 

PHYSICS 
BRIEFS© 

We have 720,000 In service on 
reasons•to make your STN INTERNATIONAL 
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even~ effective. Information Network and 

on INKA, Information System 
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• Number of records in file. 

For detailed information on the 
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lnformat1Qn$· M..1thematik CmbH 

zentrum Karlsruhe 

FIZ Karlsruhe 
D-7514 Eggenstein-Leopoldshafen 2. 
Federal Repub lic of Germany. 
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INFORMATION MARK ET No. 42 

3 



4 

Compact optical disc memory 
a blow to online data bases? 
New developments in opti­
cal storage media are cur­
rently providing some of the 
most promising innovations 
for the improvement of cost­
performance relationships in 
the office automation and 
information management­
systems fields. CD ROM 
(compact disc read only 
memory), one of the most 
important of these, offers 
tremendous potential oppor­
tunities. 

What is CD ROM? 

CD ROM is an extension of 
C_D audio technol?gy. Thus, 
discs are potentially low 
cost. In addition, they pro­
vide mass storage: one disc 
has 550 MB data capacity. 
Being small and lightweight, 
discs are transportable and 
therefore offer an alternative 
means of database distribu­
tion to online services. 
Linked, via a suitable inter­
face to a personal computer, 
a CD ROM player and disc 
allow an end user access to 
databases without the cost 
constraint of variable 
charges (such as telecommu­
nications tariffs and hosts' 
time-related access prices). 

With these cost-, storage­
and distribution-characteris­
t~cs CD ROM is widely con­
sidered to have important 
applications potentials, no­
t'.1bly in publishing and 
library documentation/ar­
chiving. The CEC, aware of 
these potentials and keen to 
promote the early introduc­
tion of the technology with 
new _information services, 
has mcludes CD ROM­
based applications as eligi­
ble for selection for part­
financing within the recent 
Call for Proposals. 

Strategies 
Closer assessment of the fu­
ture impact of CD ROM on 
the European information 
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industry will take into ac­
count a number of factors 
likely to affect the rate and 
extent of penetration and 
use. Amongst these are: 
standards problems; the 
product commercialisation 
strategies of manufacturers 
and the responses of existing 
online hosts. 
Philips and Sony, the princi­
pal firms involved in devel­
oping CD audio technology, 
agreed a standard for the 
CD player and disc. These 
same standards apply too 

for CD ROM. Recently, 
agreement has also been 
reached on the error correc­
tion codes required to en­
sure integrity of the data. 
Manufacturers have not fi­
nalised their views on the re­
quired CD player-to-pc in­
terface; indeed, each seems 
to be taking its own path. 

On the hardware side, 
the National Information 
Standards Organisation in 
the USA and the CEC in 
Europe are aware of the lack 
of standards and concerned 
that agreement between in­
terested parties should be 
developed. At this stage 
however, it is unclear how 
these bodies intend to in­
fluence future developments 
to avoid standards-related 
constraints impacting mar­
ket development and end 
user acceptance. 

More worrying, there are no 
standards for information 
retrieval software. Manufac­
turers and specialist soft­
ware houses active in devel­
oping CD ROM applica­
tions recognise that existing 
retrieval system packages 
are inadequate. Hence new 
software is being written. 
Since most manufacturers 
and software specialists 
work independently, new 
software products tend to be 
incompatible. 

Advantages 
One attractive feature of CD 
ROM is that it uses the same 
technology as CD audio. 
Hence manufacturers' in­
vestments in production fa­
cilities are minimised. Given 
the capital costs involved, 
this is an important eco­
nomic advantage. 
But demand for CD audio 
players and discs is increas­
ing rapidly. This could 
create undercapacity in pro­
duction facilities for CD 
ROM in the short-term. Al­
ternatively manufacturers, 
having risked capital re­
sources to create demand for 
CD audio, may be reluctant 
to invest further in CD 
ROM hardware production 
while the demand trend for 
CD audio continues up­
wards. This too could be a 
source of delay in CD ROM 
market development. 
For retail costs of CD ROM 
players and discs to fall sub­
stantially, mass production 
is needed. So there is a 
strong tendency amongst 
manufacturers to seek out 
clients willing to buy in CD 
ROMs for large-scale pro­
duction runs. This approach 
does not favour dealing with 
firms purchasing only small 

quantities. Yet, to help early 
and widespread dissemina­
tion, just such an approach 
may be needed, Lacking in 
the current market is a 
supply of suitable applica­
tions projects. Small com­
panies with specialist soft­
ware skills who have identi­
fied particular niches of de­
mand for new and innova­
tive CD ROM-based serv­
ices, but who have only lim­
ited capital resources are 
likely to be some of the 'man­
ufacturers' best clients in the 
next 12-18 months. 

Skimming the market 

CD ROM provides for an 
additional means for the dis­
tribution of databases. This 
could result in a trade-off 
between different media by 
information providers. 

One danger lies in the 
'cream-skimming' of the tra­
ditional online industry, still 
mainly oriented towards 
scientific and technical us­
ers. In response to this ero­
sion to its traditional client 
base, will online services be 
directed more to the still un­
tapped demand and revenue 
earning potential of the bu­
siness sector? 



DIANEGUIDE: 
;, habla usted espagnol? 
In preparation for the entry 
of Spain into the European 
Community in 1986, 58 
Spanish databases have been 
added to the directory of 
European databases, DIA­
NEGUIDE. 

These include a wide variety 
of subjects, like Acciones de 
Fomento on tenders, BIOG 
on biographies, CINE on the 
cinema and FUTB on 
sports. 

En preparation pour l'entree 
de l'Espagne.dans la Com­
munaute europeenne, 58 
bases de donnees espagnoles 
ont ete ajoutees a la direc­
toire des bases de don­
nees europeennes, DIANE­
GUIDE. 

Les bases de donnees com­
prennent un grand variete 
des sujets, comme Acciones 
de Fomento sur Jes appels 
d 'offres, BIOG sur Jes bio­
graphies, CINE sur le cine­
ma et FUTB sur Jes sports. 

Dansk vejledning til 
DIANEGUIDE 
DIANEGUIDE er en gratis 
base hos ECHO, Europa­
kommissionens vrert. Basen 
giver oplysninger om vrerter 
og baser in Europa. Den in­
deholder en beskrivelse af 
brede baser og vrerter, incl. 
servicetilbud, post- og net­
adresser. De enkelte baser 
kan soges bi.a. ved hjrelp af 
emneord. DIANEGUIDE 
opdateres l0bende og inde­
holder 600 baser. S0gning i 

basen kan ske med dansk 
vejledning. Kodeordet er 
DIANEDK, Echos net­
adresse (NUA) i Datapak 
A 9270448112. En kort be­
skrivelse af, hvordan man 
kommer i kontakt med ba­
sen, kan rekvireres i 

Dansk Diane Center, 
Danmarks Tekniske Hojskole 
Byg IOI 
DK 2800 Lyngby 
Tlf: 02 886666 

Online inf ormatie in Europa: 

Vraagt u onze niewe 
DIANEGUIDE 
• Wilt u weten welke ge­

gevensbestanden voor 
een bepaald gebied be­
staan ? 

• Wilt u weten welke ge­
gevensbestanden bij 
welke host beschikbaar 
zijn ? 

• Hebt u het adres van een 
host nodig voor een kon­
trakt? 

• Wilt u meer weten over 
de inhoud van een data­
bank? 

De DIANEGUIDE geeft u 
deze informatie met behulp 
van uw micro-of mini-com­
puter. 

Hoe? 

Door een verbvinding met 
ECHO over uw netwerk. 
Ons netwerk gebruikers 
adres (NUA) is 2704481 12. 

Als u de mededeling 
PLEASE LOGON . . . krijgt, 
toets in het toegangswoord 
DIANENL 

Dan krijgt u de nodige infor­
matie om uw recherche te 
beginnen. 

Probeer bet ui{! 
We zouden graag uw me­
ning weten. 

ENREP and ENDOC available 
to public 
ENREP, the environmental 
research projects database 
and ENDOC, an online di­
rectory of over 500 environ­
mental information and 
documentation centres in 
the Community, together 
with the services they pro-

vide are now available for a 
wider public. Both databases 
will be updated regularly 
and are accessible free of 
charge on ECHO. 
Contact : ECHO 

177 Route d'Esch 
L-1471 Luxembourg 
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There are two 
good reasons 
why Questel 
is known as 
then° 

european 
online 
information 
service! 

• Patents from all around 
the world-search our files 
for complementary coverage: 
• World Patents Index from Dervvent 

Publications Ltd. 
• European and French Patent Office 

database series. 

• Chemistry made even easier! 
• DARC, the integrated 

chemical structure 
search system speaks the 
chemist's language 

Telesystemes-Questel 
83-85, bouleva rd Vincent-A uriol - 75013 PARIS - FRANCE 
Telephone : 33. 1.582. 64.64 - Te lex · 204 594 

NAME: ___________ ___ _ 

ORGANIZATION: ___ ________ _ 

ADDRESS: _____________ _ 

CITY: _______ POSTAL CODE: _ _ _ 

COUNTRY. TELEX: __ _ 

TELEPHONE: _ _______ ____ _ 

D Please send me full documentation 
about Telesystemes-Ouestel. 
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Edicline: Host fur Management 
und Touristik 
Der Host Edicline bietet drei verschiedene Datenbanktypen 
an: Literatur- oder Referenzdatenbanken ; Faktdatenbanken 
und Volltextdatenbanken. Unabhiingig von Datenbankin­
halten und deren Autbau wird jede der drei Datenbank­
gruppen iiber die gleiche Suchsprache, STAIRS, angespro­
chen. 

Fur die Leute, die nicht zu serios sind, gibt es eine Daten-· 
bank WITZ, die Erziihlungen von Witzen und Ausspriichen 
bekannter Personen aus den Gebieten Kultur, Wirtschaft, 
Gesellschaft und Politik enthiilt. 

Andere Datenbanken schlie13en ein: 

BLIS, Betriebswirtschaftliche Literaturhinweise 
CFA, Stadteinformationen in Deutschland 
COAD, Firmeninformationen im Touristikgebiet 

HOGA, Hotel- und Gaststiittenverzeichnis 
IVIZ, Handbuch fur internationale Zusammenarbeit 
MAEX, Management/ Experten Nachweis 
MAFD, Management Fakten, Daten, Prognosen 
MTIF, Hauptstadte Informationen und Fakten weltweit 
NIDT, Nachrichten Informationsdienst Tourismus 
QUOV, Kurzgefa13te Beschreibung von 198 Landern 
PRES, Marketing- und Public Relations-Suchsystem 
RBTS, Reisebiiro Bulletin Lander Statistik 
SPO, Fakten iiber deutsche und ausliindische Sportereig­
msse 
SEKO, Beschreibung betriebswirtschaftlicher Seminare/ 
Konferenzen 
TIFA, Touristik Information Facts and Abstracts. 
CROS gibt dem Benutzer die Moglichkeit in alien Daten­
banken eine Suche zu machen. 
Kontakt : ANADOC 

Goethestralle 3 a 
D-7573 Sinzheim/Baden 
Tel : 0 72 21/8 33 50 

oder Edicline 
84 Temple Chambers, 
Temple Ave 
London EC4Y OHP 
Tel: + 44 273 813238 

Normes inf ormatiques 
Quel est !'equivalent en 
France, au Royaume Uni et 
aux USA de la norme DIN 
66 003 ? Une reponse a cette 
question peut etre donnee 
facilement et rapidement 
grace a la base de donnee 
EBISS du Bureau d'Orienta­
tion de la Normalisation en 
Informatique. Accessible en 
anglais et fran~ais, cette base 
fait le rencensement de !'en­
semble des normes et projets 
de normes realises par des 
organismes de normalisation 
officiels et non officiels en 
France, a l'etranger, au 

niveau europeen et interna­
tional. 

EBISS n'est pour le present 
accessible que sur reseau in­
terne au BNI, mais ii est tou­
tefois prevu d'en permettre, 
a titre experimental et gra­
tuit, !'interrogation directe a 
partir de terminaux video­
tex, via le reseau Transpac. 
Contacter: BNI 

Domaine de Voluceau­
Rocquencourt 
BP 105 
F-78153 Le Chesnay 
Cedex 
Tel: + 33 3 955 2535 

ADVERTISEMENT 

UK company data on Data-Star 
Data-Star, the European online service has 
added the ICC UK Companies file to those it 
already holds on West Germany, Austria and 
The Netherlands. 
Almost 1 million companies 
There are almost one million companies regis­
tered in the UK and all of these are in the Data­
Star file. Included are the basic details for 
each company, name, address, directors, when 
formed etc. For the 60,000 largest companies, 
annual accounts, key ratios and other signifi­
cant data are included, ofte·n going back for 
seven years for comparison purposes. All data 
for a company is in one easy to understand 
listing. 
Produced by ICC 
The data is produced in computer form initially 
by Inter Company Comparisons (ICC) who 
have for many years been the leaders in the 
UK in merchandising and evaluating company 
data. The file will be updated weekly to keep 
users fully informed on new companies,recently 
lodged accounts, changes in directors etc. 
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Future developments 
Further developments will include: increasing 
the number of companies with accounts data to 
over 120,000, more detail on each company, and 
shareholders of over 0.25% of stock for listed 

-r-----------1 
I Please send me details of 

I O ICC UK Company Database I 
0 Other European Company Databases 

I I am/am not a user of online at present. I 
Name _________________ _ 

I Organisation I 
Address ________________ _ --------' I TelNo 
Return to Data-Star, Plaza Suite, 114 Jermyn Street, I 

LLondon SWlY 6HJ or tel: 01-930 5503. EDN/4/85 I 

------------' 



OIC provide staff training, support 
services, brokerage and consultancy. 
BE WISE. Give them a call. Start to 
improve your services. 

Head Office Tel: UK 0380 870729 
Northern Branch Office Tel: UK 0244 336037 

Jobs en ligne 
Vous etes un cadre et vous 
avez envie de bouger? Ache­
tez une place pour une peri­
ode determinee dans la ban­
que de donnees Datacadres 
ou vous pouvez afficher Jes 
details de votre experience. 
Vous pourrez tester le 
marche pour voir s'il y a un 
poste interessant. 

Datacadres est une banque 
de donnees recensant Jes 
biographies professionnel­
les. A partir de tous Jes ren­
seignements qu'elle con­
tient : age, formations, lan­
gues pratiquees, fonctions 
occupees, remuneration, 
etc., Jes chefs du personnel 
peuvent savoir immediate­
ment si le cadre qu'ils re-

IT Index 
An international if anglo­
centric view of the impact of 
information technology on 
the process of storage, pro­
cessing and retrieval of in­
formation is contained in an 
index of conference papers 
from 1979 to 1984. The In­
dex to Information Technol­
ogy represents to the choice 
of the compiler, Silvina 
Peniston and it is a pity that, 
while she includes US and 
Canadian sources, French 

cherchent sont sur le 
marche. 

Ensuite ils peuvent selec­
tionner en ligne Jes dossiers 

necessairement anno­
nymes - qui leur convien­
nent. 

Datacadres leur permet 
d'entrer en contact avec Jes 
candidats dont le profil cor­
respond aux postes qu'ils 
ont defini. 

La qualite de la banque de 
donnees Datacadres est as­
suree par le fait que Jes bio­
graphies des cadres motives 
ne sont stockees que pour 
une periode determinee. 
Contacter: M Antoine Weil 

Datacadres 
33, rue Galilee 
F-75116 Paris 
Tel: 417237224 

and German are excluded. 

Text Retrieval in Context 
presents the papers of the 
southern branch of the Insti­
tute of Information Scien­
tists in 1984 and covers 
hardware needs, office auto­
mation, software, interfaces 
to word processors, down 
and uploading and elec­
tronic mail. 

Contact: Taylor Graham Publishers 
500 Chesham House 
150 Regent St 
London WIR 5FA 

Opening up Japan information 

S: OUTPUT FI NI SHED J I CST COPYRIGHT 
ADE~lUP lll:ru! 
••• DATABASE FEE T IME OP-FEE OOFF A OOFF F KEEP 
*** J ICSTK 01. 020 . 5 2 OC 01 OC 0 1 O 
*** TOTAL 01 , 020 5 

s: SEARCH SESSION FlNlSHS.D 1985 . 04 . 18 19 :53: 57 

Japanese database informa­
tion is being regularly ac­
cessed in Germany on the 
type of equipment used 
domestically in Japan. The 
West German group GID 
have signed an agreement 
with JICST, the Japan Infor­
mation Center of Science 
and Technology which gives 
them a password, printer 
and other terminal equip­
ment. More than 4 million 
documents are stored in the 
field of science and tech­
nology. 

Initially data is being re­
ceived mainly in Japanese 
characters. It is planned that 
a simplified version of the 
text, at first comprising titles 
in English, will be made 
available. Japanese officials 
see the agreement with Ger­
many and other trading 
partners as a means to rec­
tify the information imbal­
ance with the West. 
Contact: GID 

Raum 603 
Ahrstra8e 45 
D-5300 Bonn 2 
Tel : + 49 228 302255 

Inf ormationsberatung 
Renate Mackay 
Renate Mackay hat dreizehn 
Jahre in den verschiedensten 
Bereichen der Informations­
verarbeitung Erfahrungen 
gesammelt: - von der Infor­
mationselektion iiber die 
computergestiitzte Erschlie-
13ung bis zur Erstellung von 
Datenbankretrieval - bevor 
sie sich 1985 in Diisseldorf 
selbstandig gemacht hat. 

N eben Recherchen werden 
vor allem Beratung im Ge­
samtkomplex Fachinforma­
tion (Informationsmarkt, 
Nutzung von externen und 
internen Datenbanken, Auf­
bau von firmeneigenen Re­
cherchestellen) und Inhouse­
Schulungen im Datenbank­
retrieval angeboten. 

Die Informationsberatung 
Renate Mackay ist an alle 
wichtigen nationalen und in­
ternationalen Datenbanken 

angeschlossen und nutzt 
modernste Hard- und Soft­
ware. Ein besonderer 
Schwerpunkt liegt in der 
Durchfiihrung von Re­
cherchen in Wirtschaftsda­
tenbanken sowie englischen 
und amerikanischen Daten­
banken. 
Das Angebot richtet sich 
nach zwei Zielgruppen: 
namlich die Unternehmen, 
die ohne eigene Sach- und 
Personalkosten vom lnfor­
mationsangebot profitieren 
wollen, sowie Firmen, die 
<lurch Schulung und Bera­
tung ihre bisherigen und zu­
kiinftigen Investitionen in 
diesem Bereich absichern 
wollen. 
Kontakt : lnformationsberatung 

Renate Mackay 
Gruppellostralle 13 
D-4000 Diisseldorf 13 
Tel.: +49 211365317 

Langton consultancy 
Langton (Benelux) provide 
an information technology 
consultancy service to small 
and medium-sized organisa­
tions who need help in 
establishing an office auto­
mation strategy. 

Located centrally for com­
panies in France, Germany 
and the Benelux, Langton 
services offer design of of­
fice automation systems in­
cluding hard- and software 

selection. Possible options 
for the client include tele­
text, viewdata, electronic 
mail and access to online 
databases. Latest techniques 
in design methodology are 
employed to ensure cost ef­
fective systems. 
Contact : Dr. Carl H. Baker 

Langton (Benelux) 
44, Rue de Wiltz 
L-2734 Luxembourg 
Tel.: +352484011 
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The scandal of the national networks 
Recently the European In­
formation Market Develop­
ment Group tried out a piece 
of communications soft­
ware. It worked perfectly 
well in its country of origin, 
one of the Member States. 

Alas, many of the sophisti­
cated operations, designed 
to make life easy for online 
information retrieval, could 
not be easily implemented 
from Luxembourg. 

The same story repeated it­
self a few days later, this 
time in Strasbourg. There 
the telecommunications soft­
ware on a portable micro -
which worked without prob­
lem in the United Kingdom 
- was impossible to use with 
the French network. The 
failure was more poignant as 
the micro was supposed to 
be demonstrating one of the 
ESPRIT projects. Instead of 
using the French network, 
the operator used some 
(probably illegal) socket 
spades and had to place a 
costly, direct long distance 
telephone call. 

Why? 

The fact of the matter is that 
in the post-Euronet era, Eu­
rope's interconnected packet 

switched networks each con­
form to European (CCITT) 
standards which allow many 
possibilities for separate in­
terpretations. In practice, 
each network plays its own 
variations on the theme of 
the European norm. Some 
seem to have composed 
symphonies. Too bad for the 
travelling salesman! 
Next to the "demonstration" 
in Strasbourg was an exhibit 
on European standards. The 
truth is that each network 
seems to have its own Euro­
pean standard. While any 
micro can work with an ac­
coustic coupler as a dumb 
device, problems arise as 
soon as more "user-friendly" 
equipment or software is in­
stalled. 
Hosts have also contributed 
to the confusion. Some have 
set their own parameters to 
the network in such a way 
that otherwise time-saving 
software is rendered almost 
useless. For their own com­
mercial good, hosts need to 
establish standard proce­
dures welcoming all types of 
users. 
For logging on to a com­
puter host, a user has nor­
mally first to access a data 

1~1LINE is free ... for a week 
• Europe's leading Business Information database 
• Data on Companies, Products, Industries, Economics, Public Affairs 
• International coverage 
• Extensive indexing 
• Easy-teruse command language 

RECENTLY ADDED SOURCES 
Publications covering Gulf States, Far East, Eastern Europe, U.S.S.R., Australia and Africa. 

Just complete and return this coupon to Finsbury Data Services and you will be sent instructions for running 
searches on TEXTLINE during a week of your choice, entirely free of charge. 

To: Finsbury Data Services Ltd., 68-74 Carter Lane, LONDON, EC4V SEA, ENGLAND. TEL XX441 248 9828 TLX. 892520 

APPLICATION FOR A FREE TRIAL OF TEXTLINE 
I would like to test the TEXTLINE service on my own terminal and look forward to receiving a password and the necessary 
log-on instructions. 

COMPANY .... .. .. . . ...... ... .. . .... .. . .. . .. .... .. .. .. . . FIRST PREFERRED TRIAL DATE ... . ... .. ............ .. 

ADDRESS 

SECOND PREFERRED TRIAL DATE . . . ...... . . . . ... . .. . 

CONTACT ... . ... . ..... . . .. . . . .. . ....... . .. . . . . . . . .. .. .. . 
THIRD PREFERRED TRIAL DATE .. . ..... . .. . ...... . .. . 

TELEPHONE NO . ..... . ... . ...... . .......... . .......... . 
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network. He does this by 
dialling a certain telephone 
number and identifying him­
self by means of an NUI 
(Network User Identifier), a 
series of numbers and let­
ters. He then adds the ad­
dress of the host (Network 
Users Address). It is to avoid 
this complicated process 
that micro computer soft­
ware packages were devel­
oped. 

No single procedure for this 
simple logging on process is 
the same in Europa. Every 
network has its own combi­
nation of entering these two 
often inordinately long 
strings of numbers and let­
ters as table 1 demonstrates. 
Besides this complication, 
parameters of the networks -
a subject of arcane techni­
cality to the average user -
are different. And some net­
works, for example, require 
voltage to be supplied on 
one of the pins of the RS 232 
plug, others don 't. 

Any number of possibilities 
are provided to block pre­
vent communication. When 

this happens the user may 
receive a help message from 
the network such as LIB­
INV. 

Hardly a clinical diagnosis 
of an unduly complicated 
problem. 

It would be encouraging to 
hope that the PTis would 
reform this state of affairs, 
themselves. In other words, 
return the state of advance­
ment to that of a few years 
ago when, with Euronet, 
there was one access proce­
dure for all participating 
countries. 

At the very least the lesson 
should be learned. This is a 
level of confusion the cus­
tomer can very well do with­
out. More powerful net­
works being brought into 
use over the next few years 
must not suffer from the 
same short sighted prob­
lems. 

A higher level of coopera­
tion is needed from the peo­
ple who have not yet 
brought us the European 
postage stamp. 

A you have problems with your network, 
please let us know; we might be able to help. 

European Information Development Group 
177 Route d'Esch, L-1471 Luxembourg, 
Tel.: +352 488041. 

Spanish coordination 
Representatives of the Euro­
pean Commission, DG 
XIII, including information 
market director C Jansen 
van Rosendaal , met with 
Spanish representatives of 
ministries, universities, li­
braries, databank producers 
and users on 16-17 October 

in Madrid to coordinate ac­
tivities prior to the entry of 
Spain into the Community 
in 1986. 
Spanish representatives 
meeting in Toldeo were also 
given a presentation of the 
Apollo document delivery 
system. 

Table onogon pfoceil~ 
To log on, users dial a network node and receive 
a network tone. After that the procedure varies 
from country to country. The following table, for 
indicative P.Urposes only, gives some idea what 
the user must then do. Procedures may be subject 
to change. Check with your local PlT! 

Country 

Austria 

Belgium 
Denmark 

Federal Republic 
of Germany 

France 
Greece 
Ireland 

Italy 
Luxembourg 
Netherlands 
Portugal 

Spain 

Sweden 

Switzerland 

Procedure 

.& 
NUl<NUI>& 
<PASSWORD>& 
0<NUA>& 
<NUl>-0<NUA>& 
&&SP& 
N<NUl>-A9<NUA> 
.& 
NUl<NUI>& 
<PASSWORD>& 
0<NUA>& 
0<NUA>P (or D) <NUI> 
<NUA><NUI> 
... & 
NUl<NUI>& 
<PASSWORD>& 
0<NUA>CR 
N<NUl>-<NUA>& 
?N<NUl>-0<NUA>& 
N<NUl>-<NUA>& 
H& 
<NUA>P (or D) 
CIT-<NUI>& 
Terminal identifier & 
<NUI>; <PASSWORD>& 
2704<NUA>& 
Terminal identifier & 
<USERNAME>: 68 (or 69 
or 71); 
<PASSWORD>; <NUA>& 
.& 
NUl<NUI>& 
<PASSWORD>& 
0<NUA>& 

United Kingdom &A2 (or other 
terminal identifier) & 
N<NUI>& 
A9<NUA>& 

& = carriage return; NUI = network user iden­
tification; NUA = network users address (the 
computer to be contacted); the brackets <> indi­
cate that the user must tap in the corresponding 
strings of numbers or letters; the brackets O indi­
cate that the user has .a choice of two or more 
possibilities depending what he reguires. 

ON-LINE USERS ARE DELIGHTED WITH 
THIS USER-FRIENDLY IRISH COMMUNI­
CATIONS AND EMULATION SOFTWARE. 

lnteractltie Communication Software 
IMPROVED EFFICIENCY GIVES A FAST 
RETURN ON THE PURCHASE PRICE OF 
£280 STG. 

COMPUTER APPLIED TECHNIQUES LTD. 
3, ST. JAMES' TERRACE, MALAHIDE, 
CO. DUBLIN, IRELAND. 
TEL: +353 1 450921 
TLX: 31432 FJK EI 
EUROKOM: FRED KENNEDY 
TELECOM GOLD: 74:EIM158 

..... ............. ····· ..... .. ... ............... ...... .... ... ... ... ..... . .. ... ... ... . ... . ...... ... ... ... ... .. ...... ... ... ... .. . ... ... .. . .. ... . .. . . ... ... ... ······ ... ............ .. . ............ . 
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Co~ion listens to views on financial 
information senices in Europe 
The financial information 
market is one of the fastest 
growing areas in online elec­
tronic information. Services 
supplying this information 
in Europe are, however, far 
from smug. Europe is expe­
riencing slower growth than 
USA and there are a number 
of important braking factors 
on efforts to supply fast and 
efficient information and 
decision making systems to 
the financial market. 
Some 25 organisations in­
cluding European and 
American banks, financial 
information services and 
members of Community in-

Irish users 
Users or those interested in 
obtaining information on 
online systems, procedures 
and prices can obtain infor­
mation from IIRS. 
Contact: IIRS 

Ballymun Road 
El-Dublin 9 
Tel: +353 1 370101 

stitutions met in Luxem­
bourg on 1 October on the 
invitation of the European 
Commission. 

The aim of the "workshop" 
was to identify possible ar­
eas for Community action to 
encourage the development 
of this specialised sector. 
Among those who attended 
were representatives of Citi­
bank, Kredietbank and So­
ciete Generale de Banque 
from Belgium, NatWest, 
Standard and Chartered, 
Midland Bank from the UK, 
the Bank of Greece and 
Scandinaviska Enskilda 
Bank, SWIFT, the interbank 
network, together with such 
services as I P Sharp, Tele­
kurs, Chase/ Interactive 
Data Corp, Cisi Wharton, 
Telerate. 
As the financial market is a 
24 hour world market the 
meeting was directed at im­
pediments in present struc­
tures rather than a debate on 
US/ European division of 
the present market. Six main 

Legal Observatory viewpoint 

The first meeting of the 
Commission's Legal Obser­
vatory for the European in­
formation market took place 
in Luxembourg on 14 Octo­
ber. It identified three prior­
ity issues for study over the 
coming year: 
I. access to information 

held by the public sec­
tor; 

2. inconsistencies in legal 
rights and obligations 
applicable to different 
categories of information 
providers; and 

3. legal problems related to 
teleshopping and tele­
banking. 

It was further decided that 
the issue of the legal protec­
tion of computer software 
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and data bases content be 
examined in the light of the 
Commission's Green Paper 
on Copyright that will come 
out early next year. The 
meeting also discussed the 
specific issue of the inclu­
sion of legal persons in data 
protection legislation, on 
which there were contribu­
tions by the International 
Chamber of Commerce and 
legal experts from the Com­
munity Member States. It 
was recommended that no 
Community action be taken 
before there was concrete 
evidence of market distor­
tions or other discrepancies 
from such inclusion. 
Contact: Mr Georges Papapavlou 

C.E.C., DG XIII/B. 
L-2920 Luxembourg. 

areas of action were agreed 
on by the participants. 
I. The PTTs should be en­
couraged to provide much 
more flexible services. Parti­
cipants strongly expressed 
the view that current PTT 
regulations are major reason 

causing European informa­
tion services to be held back 
and to lag behind the North 
American market. Some 
PTTs, it was noted, were be­
ginning to offer their own fi­
nancial services and it was 
recommended that proper 
"rules of the game" should 

be initiated in regard to PTT 
activities. 
2. An enhanced degree of 
de-regulation would have a 
major influence not only on 
financial services themselves 
but would also create new 
opportunities for informa-

tion services. Participants 
identified three examples 
where information services 
could benefit: liberalisation 
and integration of capital 
markets; freedom of esta­
blishment and harmonisa­
tion of means of payments 
and settlements. Stock ex-

ESA·IRS, the European Space Agency's 
Information Retrieval Service, offers the 
widest scientific and technological infor­
mation coverage, with over 70 databases 
containing 30 million references, 
worldwide access possibilities through 
national and international data transmis-

r-----------------~ I without commitment, I should like to know more about I 
I ESA·IRS I 
I Name I 
I I 
I Company . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . I 
I Address .. . ... . . . . I 
I I 
L~~~~~~~~~~~~~-~~~J 

and send to: 

Gesa ESA Information Retrieval Service 
C.P. 64 · 00044 Frascati , Italy 
~ (39/6) 94011 telex 610637 



change information, for ex­
ample, is one area which is 
less developed in Europe 
due to lack of integration of 
capital markets. 
3. Public administrations are 
often sitting on valuable raw 
data which should be made 
available to European infor­
mation suppliers. With a 
view to creating information 
for the international market, 
it would be helpful if guide­
lines for a common ap­
proach to the conditions un­
der which this material 
should be offered could be 
produced at the Community 
level. 
4. While recognising the 
work being done on stand­
ards generally, the partici­
pants recommended that ur­
gent attention was needed to 
be paid to application-level 
information format stand­
ards. This urgency arises 
from the increased number 
and variety of services find­
ing their way onto the users 
desk and work environment. 
Community-level action to 
promote information format 
standards both for the end­
user and in making raw ma­
terial available for informa­
tion suppliers would be par­
ticularly valuable. 
5. Closer collaboration 
could be encouraged be­
tween universities and finan-

cial information services to 
help provide socio-economic 
data or direct collaboration 
on services. Such coopera­
tive ventures had played a 
positive role in the creation 
of North American services. 
6. Financial information 
services in Europe have 
achieved only a third of the 
penetration of those in the 
United States. Major infor­
mation suppliers have a 
clear picture of the need for 
their services, but there are 
many areas of unexploited 
potential for example, 
among small businesses. Im­
proved understanding of the 
demand structure would 
greatly assist in the opening 
up of the European market 
and bring the benefits of fi­
nancial information services 
to a wider range of organisa­
tions. Community action to 
promote better understand­
ing of demand and aware­
ness would help stimulate 
the growth of the European 
financial information serv­
ices market. 
The Commission would es­
pecially like to hear from 
other firms in the market 
who are experiencing obsta­
cles to growth that could be 
tackled at a European level. 
Contact: Mr Garth Davies, 

DG XIII/B, CEC, 
L-2920 Luxembourg 

European Institute for Information Management, 13 rue de 
Bragance. L-Luxembourg, tel: + 352 44 58 11 

18-20 February, Luxembourg 
1986 

25-7 February, Luxembourg 
1986 

4-6 March, 1986 Luxembourg 

Lecture series on new 
media in telecommuni­
cations, directed by 
Prof. H. Zimmermann 

Series on the economics 
of information, directed 
by Prof. M. Ricketts 

Series on information 
policy, directed by M. 
J. Michel of ICSTI. 

ECHO, 177 Route d'Esch, L-1471 Luxembourg, 
tel: +352 48 80 41 

3-5 December 

JO December 

12 December 

London 

Lisbon 

Porto 

International Online 

Euronet DIANE Work­
shop 

Euronet DIANE Work­
shop 

GBDL, Gesellschaft fiir Bibliothekswesen und Dokumenta­
tion des Landbaues, Prof. W. Laux, Biologische Bundesan­
stalt fiir Land- und Forstwirtschaft, Konigin-Luise-Str. 19, 
D-100 Berlin 33, Tel.: +49 30 83 04-2 15 

14.-7. April 1986 Berlin Vor- und Nachteile 
arbeitsteiliger 
Informationssysteme 

Online International Pinner Green House Ash Drive, GB­
Pinner HAS 2AE, Middlesex, tel.: + 44 I 868 44 66 

4-5 March, 1986 London Value Added & Data 
Network Services 

4-6 March, 1986 London Business Telecom '86 

ln--------------------------EDN1 
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How to go online 
start ) 

Do you already 
have a micro 
computer or 

word processor? 

yes• 
I 

Does it have a 

no ......................................... 

terminal emulator ~~ • • • • • • 1 
programme and 1 

a modem? • 

yes: 

C 
C: .. 

I 
I 
I 
I 

\.,Ill Jl hl· 
l1HH.i1licd' C 

C: 
. .. 

.1110thc1 model 
,II ,lli.ihic' 

y~: ............. :y~ 

no 

~ - ---- -
yes 

h 11 k.i...1hk 
,llld L,lll \Olli 

,1!!rl'1,.'ll1t...·111 he 
'"d1.1nged' 

Buy or hire a 
modem or 

accoustic coupler 

no ........•• 

•••............• 

do you want 
a new 

terminal? 

go to a 
broker 

.yes 

Lease or 
buy? 

contact 
suppliers 
(yellow 
pages) 

... rcc1h 
·( ( 1 n -,2x·· 

ensure that 
you can get a 
telephone line 

in-house 
................ 

get network 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • password from 

your PTf 

Check which 
databases or hosts 

are available. 
DIANEE - free 

password on ECHO; 
NUA is 270448112 

contact other hosts 
for passwords 

• = questions you should ask start 
your manufacturer/ supplier searching 

General information 
- To obtain general infom,ation (lists of hosts, PTis, inter­

mediaries, user groups, etc.), write to : 

Euronet DIANE, 177, route d'Esch, L-1471 Luxembourg 

- For specific questions or problems: 

Telephone: Luxembourg (+352) 488041, Telex: 2181. 

The Euronet DIANE team will call you back to save telephone 
costs. 

DEC. 1985/ JAN. 1986 

I. Ask for a NUI (network user identifier) 
from your local PIT-representative. 

- in United Kingdom for IPSS/PSS/Multi­
stream 
Customer Service Group, Room G07 
Lutyens House, 1-6 Finsbury Circus 
London EC2M 7L Y 
Tel.: 9200661 

- in Ireland for Euronet and Eirpac 
Mr D. Crawford 
Telecom Eirann 
6-8 College Green 
Dublin 2 
Tel: 778222 

- in Denmark for Datapak 
Generaldirektoret for Post­
og Telegrafvaensenet 
Roedovrevej 241 
DK-2610 Roedovre 
Tel: (1) 415055 

- in Sweden for Datapak 
Mrs Gunnel Kling 
Telekantoret 
Data Section 
Box 7294 
S-10390 Stockholm 
Tel: (8) 7806228 

The NUI authorises you to connect to the 
public data network in your country. 
Rent a modem from the PIT or buy one. 
At the same time make a choice of hosts, 
databases and databanks using DIANE 
GUIDE. 
2. Sign an agreement with the respective hosts 
where the chosen databanks and databases 
are available for online searching. 
3. You will receive a password from the 
host(s) which authorizes you to search the 
chosen databanks and databases. 
4. These are all the requirements you need. 
The PIT and hosts will invoice you for your 
use of the network and the databases/data­
banks respectively. 


